

BID TABULATION

RFB #7709

HEATING, COOLING, AND PLUMBING SERVICES

	McKenney Mechanical Contractors, Inc.	M.J. Daly, LLC	Tucker Mechanical, Inc.
Standard Labor Rates			
P1 Plumber	No Bid	\$145.00 per hour	\$115 per hour
P2 Plumber	\$134.50 per hour	\$145.00 per hour	\$115 per hour
S1 Plumber	No Bid	\$145.00 per hour	\$115 per hour
S2 Plumber	\$134.50 per hour	\$145.00 per hour	\$115 per hour
Registered Apprentice	\$110.00 per hour	\$109.00 per hour	\$115 per hour
Premium Labor Rates			
P1 Plumber	No Bid	\$213.00 per hour OT \$257.00 per hour DT	\$170 per hour
P2 Plumber	\$176.50 per hour	\$213.00 per hour OT \$257.00 per hour DT	\$170 per hour
S1 Plumber	No Bid	\$213.00 per hour OT \$257.00 per hour DT	\$170 per hour
S2 Plumber	\$176.50 per hour	\$213.00 per hour OT \$257.00 per hour DT	\$170 per hour
Registered Apprentice	\$144.50 per hour	\$160.00 per hour OT \$193.00 per hour DT	\$170 per hour
Mark-up on materials	25%	20%	15%

Non-Responsive Bidders:

Mullen Mechanical, Inc.

Sharon Strain

06/29/2022