

Bid Tabulation
RFB #7611
Equipment Rental Service

Labor / Equipement		A & J Construction	A. Vitti Excavators, LLC	FGB Construction Company	Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming, Inc.	Natale Construction Corp.	Reliable Excavating Co., Inc.	Rich Green Landscapes, LLC	Sound Beach Services, Inc.
1a	3/4 to 1 C.Y. Backhoe/Excavator	no bid	\$ 135.00	\$ 250.00	no bid	\$ 165.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 160.00
1b	3/4 to 1 C.Y. Backhoe/Excavator with attached hammer	no bid	\$ 175.00	\$ 325.00	no bid	\$ 320.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 250.00
2a	1 1/4 to 1 1/2 C.Y. Backhoe/Excavator	no bid	\$ 175.00	\$ 250.00	no bid	\$ 170.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 175.00
2b	1 1/4 to 1 1/2 C.Y. Backhoe/Excavator with attached hammer	no bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 325.00	no bid	\$ 400.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 185.00	\$ 325.00
3a	2 to 2 1/2 C.Y. Backhoe/Excavator	no bid	\$ 200.00	\$ 310.00	no bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 225.00
3b	2 to 2 1/2 C.Y. Backhoe/Excavator with attached hammer	no bid	\$ 275.00	\$ 450.00	no bid	\$ 440.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 400.00
4	Truck (6 C.Y. Water Level)	no bid	\$ 80.00	\$ 105.00	no bid	\$ 95.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 95.00
5	10 Wheeler (11-12 C.Y. Water Level)	no bid	\$ 90.00	\$ 130.00	no bid	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 105.00
6	Tri-Axel (15-22 C.Y. Water Level)	\$ 155.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 130.00	no bid	\$ 110.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 110.00
7	1 1/2 C.Y. Rubber Tire Loader	no bid	\$ 120.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 145.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 160.00
8	2 C.Y. Rubber Tire Loader	no bid	\$ 130.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 275.00	no bid	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 200.00
9	2 1/2 C.Y. Rubber Tire Loader	no bid	\$ 130.00	no bid	\$ 275.00	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 200.00
10	3 C.Y. Rubber Tire Loader	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 215.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 185.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 200.00
11	4 C.Y. Rubber Tire Loader	no bid	\$ 175.00	\$ 230.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 225.00	no bid	\$ 225.00
12	6 C.Y. Rubber Tire Loader	no bid	\$ 195.00	\$ 320.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 300.00	no bid	no bid
13	1 1/2 - 2 C.Y. Loader/Dozer	no bid	\$ 125.00	\$ 195.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 160.00
14	2.5 to 3.5 C.Y. Loader/Dozer	no bid	\$ 135.00	\$ 225.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 175.00	no bid	no bid
15	5 C.Y. Loader/Dozer	no bid	\$ 200.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 275.00	no bid	no bid
16	Loader/Backhoe (specify size and make)	no bid	\$ 125.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 100.00	no bid
17	Loader/Backhoe with Hammer	no bid	\$ 175.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 160.00	no bid
18	Over the road Tractor-Truck with Flat Bed	no bid	\$ 140.00	\$ 190.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	no bid
19	Trailer capable of moving 40 tons	no bid	\$ 140.00	\$ 190.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 200.00	no bid	\$ 200.00
20	Rubber Tire Grader (indicate type and model year)	no bid	\$ 165.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 345.00	no bid	\$ 275.00	\$ 125.00	no bid
21	22-25 C.Y. Trailer Dump Truck	no bid	\$ 145.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 275.00	no bid	no bid
22	1-Gun Compressor fully equipped with operator	no bid	\$ 100.00	\$ 150.00	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 125.00
23	2-Gun Compressor fully equipped with operator	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 250.00	no bid	\$ 210.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 220.00	\$ 175.00
24	Concrete Saw	no bid	\$ 145.00	\$ 75.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 125.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 125.00
25	1 to 3 Ton Roller	no bid	\$ 100.00	\$ 130.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 100.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 100.00
26	3 to 5 Ton Roller	no bid	\$ 110.00	\$ 150.00	no bid	\$ 95.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 100.00
27	10 Ton Roller	no bid	\$ 145.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 275.00	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 125.00
28	Vibratory Earth Compactor/Roller	no bid	\$ 135.00	\$ 165.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 125.00
29	Pick-Up Truck	\$ 130.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 35.00	no bid	\$ 80.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 75.00
30	Rubber Tire Tractor with Sickle Bar/Mower	no bid	\$ 100.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 100.00	no bid
31	3" Centrifugal Pump	no bid	\$ 10.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 75.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 75.00

Bid Tabulation
RFB #7611
Equipment Rental Service

Labor / Equipement		A & J Construction	A. Vitti Excavators, LLC	FGB Construction Company	Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming, Inc.	Natale Construction Corp.	Reliable Excavating Co., Inc.	Rich Green Landscapes, LLC	Sound Beach Services, Inc.
32	4" Centrifugal Pump	no bid	\$ 20.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 75.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 100.00
33	6" Centrifugal Pump	no bid	\$ 40.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 125.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 200.00
	* Pumps include 25' Suction hose & adequate Discharge Hose								
34	Automatic, self propelled Asphalt Paver w/ minimum 4-5 Ton hopper, paver width minimum 12 feet, including operator	no bid	\$ 200.00	\$ 410.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 250.00	no bid	\$ 250.00
35	Front End Rubber Tire Loader with a 2 cubic yard, 4 in 1 Hydraulic Bucket including operator	no bid	\$ 175.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 250.00	\$ 125.00	no bid
36	Mechanical Sweeper	\$ 205.00	\$ 110.00	no bid	\$ 250.00	no bid	\$ 350.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 250.00
37	Mobil Crusher	no bid	\$ 275.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 1,000.00	no bid	\$ 350.00
38	VacAll	no bid	\$ 180.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 500.00	no bid	no bid
39	Mini-Excavator	no bid	\$ 135.00	\$ 200.00	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 125.00
40	Hydraulic Hammer/Rams	no bid	\$ 145.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 175.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 200.00
41	Skid Steer	\$ 220.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 125.00
42	Skid Steer with attachments	no bid	\$ 120.00	\$ 200.00	no bid	\$ 170.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 175.00
43	Rubber Tire Hydraulic Excavator w/ 3 buckets(specify type/size)	no bid	\$ 200.00	\$ 200.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 275.00	no bid	no bid
44	Rubber Tire Hydraulic Hammer (specify type/size)	no bid	\$ 250.00	\$ 325.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 275.00	\$ 150.00	no bid
45	Small Pavement Milling Machine	\$ 280.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 500.00	no bid	\$ 750.00	\$ 150.00	no bid
46	Large Pavement Milling Machine	\$ 685.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 625.00	\$ 800.00	no bid	\$ 1,500.00	no bid	no bid
47	Curbing Machine	no bid	\$ 45.00	\$ 130.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00
48	Screening Machine	no bid	\$ 100.00	\$ 135.00	no bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 250.00
49	Foreman	\$ 155.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 105.00	no bid	\$ 80.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 85.00
50	Mason	no bid	\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	no bid	\$ 85.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 75.00
51	Laborer	\$ 130.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 90.00	no bid	\$ 50.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 62.00
52	Gunite Pump	no bid	\$ 300.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
53	Pipe TV Camera per l.f.	no bid	\$ 5.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
54	Portable Generators	no bid	\$ 45.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00
55	Portable Lights	no bid	\$ 45.00	\$ 80.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 25.00	\$ 50.00
56	Office Trailer per week	no bid	\$ 650.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 100.00	\$ 250.00
57	Office Trailer per month	no bid	\$ 1,800.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 300.00	\$ 500.00
58	Horizontal Shaft Wood Waste Grinder	no bid	\$ 335.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
59	Grapple-equipped Hydraulic Excavator	no bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 235.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 500.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 300.00
60	Chipper, Brush, 18" - to 200 HP - Trailer Mounted	no bid	\$ 285.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 200.00	no bid
61	Dozer, Crawler - to 375 HP	no bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 225.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 350.00	\$ 125.00	no bid
62	Graders - Moldboard Size - 12 feet - to 150 HP	no bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 345.00	no bid	\$ 300.00	\$ 125.00	no bid

**Bid Tabulation
RFB #7611
Equipment Rental Service**

Labor / Equipement		A & J Construction	A. Vitti Excavators, LLC	FGB Construction Company	Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming, Inc.	Natale Construction Corp.	Reliable Excavating Co., Inc.	Rich Green Landscapes, LLC	Sound Beach Services, Inc.
63	Loader, Crawler - Bucket Capacity - 4 c.y. - to 238 HP	no bid	\$ 200.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 125.00	no bid
64	Tub Grinder - to 440 HP	no bid	\$ 325.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
65	Tub Grinder - to 630 HP	no bid	\$ 325.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
66	Tub Grinder - to 760 HP	no bid	\$ 335.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
67	Tub Grinder - to 1000 HP	no bid	\$ 400.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
68	Horizontal Grinder - min. 630 HP	no bid	\$ 325.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
69	Stump Grinder - 102 HP	no bid	\$ 300.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 300.00	no bid	no bid
70	Stump Grinder - 110 HP	no bid	\$ 300.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 350.00	no bid	no bid
71	Tymco 210H Regenerative Air Parking Lot Sweeper or Equivalent	no bid	\$ 110.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
72	Tymco 210 Regenerative Air Parking Lot Sweeper or Equivalent	no bid	\$ 110.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid