

Bid Tabulation
RFB #7565
Sod Removal and Installation

	Athletic Field Services, LLC	US Pitchcare LLC	Winding Brook Turf Farm, Inc
SOD REMOVAL AND INSTALLATION	per square foot	per square foot	per square foot
Amount less than 5,000 square feet			
Bluegrass sod	\$ 1.20	\$ 0.88	\$ 1.05
RTF sod	\$ 1.30	\$ 0.88	\$ 1.08
Amount between 5,000 – 10,000 square feet			
Bluegrass sod	\$ 1.02	\$ 0.80	\$ 1.03
RTF sod	\$ 1.12	\$ 0.80	\$ 1.06
HGT sod	\$ 1.12	\$ 0.80	no bid
Amount more than 10,000 square feet			
Bluegrass sod	\$ 0.80	\$ 0.75	\$ 0.85
RTF sod	\$ 0.90	\$ 0.75	\$ 0.88
HGT sod	\$ 0.90	\$ 0.75	no bid
TURF TREATMENTS			
Price per square foot for materials and labor to provide reverse rototill, Harley rake, finish grade and roll	\$ 0.35	\$ 0.49	\$ 0.25
Price per square foot for materials and labor to provide deep tine aerification (40,000 square foot minimum)	\$ 0.03	\$ 0.20	no bid
Price per square foot for materials and labor to provide core aerification (40,000 square foot minimum)	\$ 0.02	\$ 0.20	no bid
Price per square foot for materials and labor to provide seed-a-vator overseeding (40,000 square foot minimum). Seed to be supplied by the Town.	\$ 0.04	\$ 0.018	\$ 0.05
Price per square foot for materials and labor to provide top dressing (includes core aerification, top dressing, and mat drag in). Town to supply top dressing, either sand or compost.	\$ 0.08	\$ 0.62	no bid
INFIELD CLAY CONDITIONING			
60' Little League Baseball infield	Price per clay infield size	Price per clay infield size	Price per clay infield size
Heavy weed infestation	\$ 1,920.00	\$ 3,200.00	no bid
Light weed infestation	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 2,700.00	no bid
90' Baseball infield			
Heavy weed infestation	\$ 2,020.00	\$ 5,600.00	no bid
Light weed infestation	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 5,100.00	no bid
Little League Softball infield			
Heavy weed infestation	\$ 1,920.00	\$ 5,200.00	no bid
Light weed infestation	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 4,800.00	no bid
Industrial League Softball infield			
Heavy weed infestation	\$ 2,020.00	\$ 5,600.00	no bid
Light weed infestation	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 5,100.00	no bid
ADDITIONAL RATES			
Hourly Labor Rate for any additional work	\$65.00 / per hour	no bid / per hour	\$75.00 / per hour
Percentage Mark Up on Purchase of Material	15%	10%	20%