

**Bid Tabulation**  
**RFB #7551**  
**Botanical Supplies**

Item	Carriere Materials	Chas C. Hart Seed	Grass Roots	Metro Turf	Pinnacle Turf, Inc.	Site One Landscape	The Terre Company	Valley Green, Inc.	West-chester Turf
<b>FUNGICIDES:</b>									
Headway	No Bid	1 day	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Daconil Action	No Bid	3 days	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Subdue Maxx-Link Pack	No Bid	1 day	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Heritage	No Bid	2 days	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Banner Maxx-Link Pack	No Bid	2 days	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Daconil Flo Weatherstik	No Bid	3 days	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Daconil Ultrex	No Bid	3 days	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	1 day	1 day
Banol	No Bid	1 day	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Chipco Signature	No Bid	2 days	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Briskway	No Bid	1 day	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Clearys 3336 Plus	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$456.44 - 1 day	No Bid	No Bid	\$510.00 - 1 day	\$540.00 - 3 days	\$400.00 - 1 day
Tartan Stressguard	No Bid	2 days	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Prosterity	No Bid	2 days	105 oz cont. 1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Secure	No Bid	No Bid	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Segway	No Bid	\$415.00 - 3 days	\$415.00 - 1 day	\$415.00 - 1 day	No Bid	\$415.00 - 1 day	\$518.00 - 1 day	\$415.00 - 1 day	\$415.00 - 1 day
<b>HERBICIDES:</b>									
Dimension 2EW	No Bid	\$1,077.50 - 2 days	\$1077.50 - 1 day	\$1077.50 - 1 day	No Bid	\$1077.50 - 1 day	\$1077.50 - 1 day	\$1077.50 - 1 day	\$1,100.00 - 1 day
Proxy	No Bid	\$218.83 - 3 days	\$148.00 - 1 day	\$162.85 - 1 day	No Bid	\$386.22 - 1 day	\$180.00 - 1 day	\$186.00 - 3 days	\$205.00 - 1 day
Primo Maxx	No Bid	3 days	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
<b>INSECTICIDES:</b>									
Acelpryn	No Bid	1 day	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Provaunt	No Bid	3 days	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
Ference	No Bid	2 days	1 day	1 day	No Bid	1 day	1 day	3 days	1 day
<b>WETTING AGENTS</b>									

**Bid Tabulation**  
**RFB #7551**  
**Botanical Supplies**

Item	Carriere Materials	Chas C. Hart Seed	Grass Roots	Metro Turf	Pinnacle Turf, Inc.	Site One Landscape	The Terre Company	Valley Green, Inc.	West-chester Turf
Dispatch	No Bid	\$468.75 - 3 days	\$468.75 - 1 day	\$468.75 - 1 day	No Bid	\$468.76 - 1 day	No Bid	\$475.00 - 3 days	No Bid
Helmsman	No Bid	No Bid	\$152.00 - 1 day	\$152.00 - 1 day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mariner	No Bid	No Bid	\$318.25 - 1 day	\$318.25 - 1 day	No Bid	Lesco Moisture Manager \$215.20 - 1 day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Propel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$149.54 - 2 days	Lesco Flo Ultra \$232.48 - 1 day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>FERTILIZERS:</b>									
Floratine Phlex-man	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$216.50 - 2 days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Milorg. Greens Grade	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.95 - 1 day	No Bid	\$13.32 - 1 day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Pk Fight 0-0-28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$251.00 - 2 days	Brandt 0-0-25 \$122.48 - 1 day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Plant Marvel	No Bid	No Bid	\$33.00 - 1 day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$39.00 - 1 day
Nutrite 17-0-17	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.80 - 1 day	No Bid	18-0-18 E \$39.78 - 1 day	No Bid	\$34.30 - 1 day	No Bid
Nutrite 22-0-22	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$34.35 - 1 day	No Bid	19-0-19 N \$26.00 - 1 day	\$36.00 - 3 days	\$31.60 - 1 day	No Bid
Nutrite 28-0-8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$28.75 - 1 day	No Bid	25-0-6 \$23.00 - 1 day	\$26.00 - 3 days	No Bid	No Bid
Nutrite 14-24-12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.50 - 1 day	No Bid	18-24-12 \$22.00 - 1 day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Shaws 19-0-19 Platinum	No Bid	\$59.22 - 3 days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Lesco 19-0-19 \$29.00 - 1 day	No Bid	No Bid	\$56.00 - 1 day

**Bid Tabulation**  
**RFB #7551**  
**Botanical Supplies**

Item	Carriere Materials	Chas C. Hart Seed	Grass Roots	Metro Turf	Pinnacle Turf, Inc.	Site One Landscape	The Terre Company	Valley Green, Inc.	West-chester Turf
Shaws 30-0-0 w/dimension/acelpryn fairway grade with GroGard	No Bid	\$83.66 - 3 days	No Bid	Lebanon 30-0-10 \$79.25 - 1 Day	No Bid	30-0-10 \$149.05 - 1 day	No Bid	No Bid	\$85.00 - 1 day
XP micro	No Bid	No Bid	\$228.00 - 1 day	\$228.00 - 1 day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Nutrite 28-7-14 Water Soluble	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$26.00 - 1 day	No Bid	\$31.67 - 1 day	\$27.00 - 3 days	\$24.78 - 1 day	No Bid
<b><u>SPECIALTY PRODUCTS:</u></b>									
50-50 Tee Divot Mix Ton	\$130.0 - 2 days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
50-50 Tee Divot Mix CY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
120 Bunker Sand (USGA Specs) Ton	\$62.00 - 2 days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
120 Bunker Sand (USGA Specs) CY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
P.35 Heat Treated top dressing Ton	\$84.00 - 2 days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
P.35 Heat Treated top dressing CY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
P.40 Heat Treated top dressing Ton	\$84.00 - 2 days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
P.40 Heat Treated top dressing CY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Greens Top Dressing Wet Ton	\$62.00 - 1 day	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Greens Top Dressing Wet CY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid