

Bid Tabulation
RFB #7523
A/C Duct Cleaning Services

		Duct & Vent Cleaning of America, Inc.	Induct Industries Inc.
Unlined Sheet Metal Ducts	Cross Section: 0-1 SF	\$ 5.40 /lf	No Bid /lf
	Cross Section: 1-4 SF	\$ 5.40 /lf	No Bid /lf
	Cross Section: 4 SF & up	\$ 5.40 /lf	No Bid /lf
Lined Sheet Metal Ducts	Cross Section: 0-1 SF	\$ 5.40 /lf	No Bid /lf
	Cross Section: 1-4 SF	\$ 5.40 /lf	No Bid /lf
	Cross Section: 4 SF & up	\$ 5.40 /lf	No Bid /lf
Fiberboard Ducts	Cross Section: 0-1 SF	\$ 5.40 /lf	\$ 2.60 /sf
	Cross Section: 1-4 SF	\$ 5.40 /lf	\$ 2.60 /sf
	Cross Section: 4 SF & up	\$ 5.40 /lf	\$ 2.60 /sf
Spiral Ducts	6" - 12"	\$ 5.40 /lf	No Bid /lf
	12" - 24"	\$ 5.40 /lf	No Bid /lf
Flexible Ducts	6" - 18"	\$ 5.40 /lf	\$ 2,985.00 /project
Air Handlers (Including evaporator coils, Mixing boxes, filters, etc.)	0-5 Ton (Including 5)	\$ 337.50 /ea	No Bid /ea
	5-10 Ton (Including 10)	\$ 450.00 /ea	No Bid /ea
	10-25 Ton (Including 25)	\$ 675.00 /ea	No Bid /ea
	25 Ton and Up	\$ 1,350.00 /ea	\$ 1,865.00 /AHU
Heat exchanger	Varying Sizes	\$ 250.00 /ea	\$ 395.00 /AHU
Energy Wheel	Varying Sizes	\$ 250.00 /ea	\$ 395.00 /AHU
Diffusers/Registers	Varying Models/Styles	\$ 10.00 /ea	\$ 2,985.00 /project
NADCA Vacuum Test		\$ 95.00 /ea	\$ 595.00 /project