

BID TABULATION
RFB #7502
SURVEYING SERVICES

Discipline	AI Engineers, Inc.		Ahnem Kirby LLC.		Dimarzo & Berezky Inc.		GM2 Associates Inc.		J. Edwards & Associates, LLC		Martinez Couch & Associates, LLC		Milone & MacBroom, Inc.		Pepeira Engineering, LLC		Redniss & Mead, Inc.		Rocco V. D'Andrea, Inc.		
	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	Price per Hour	
1. Licensed Land Surveyor	\$ 145.00	\$ 98.50	\$ 175.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 123.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 157.60	\$ 115.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 125.00	No Bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 261.00	\$ 235.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 70.00	
2. 2-Man Survey Crew	\$ 170.00	\$ 129.50	\$ 160.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 158.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 151.90	\$ 150.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 170.00
3. 3-Man Survey Crew	\$ 225.00	\$ 155.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 173.00	\$ 190.00	No Bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 261.00	\$ 235.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 261.00	\$ 235.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 261.00	\$ 235.00	\$ 261.00	\$ 235.00	\$ 261.00	\$ 235.00	
4. Draftsman	\$ 70.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 63.00	\$ 82.00	\$ 95.70	\$ 75.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	
5. Technician	\$ 90.00	\$ 79.50	\$ 90.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 103.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 95.70	\$ 50.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.70	\$ 50.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	
6. Clerical	\$ 65.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 70.00	No Bid	\$ 50.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 70.00	No Bid	\$ 50.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	
Cost of Reproductions	B&W	Color	B&W	Color	B&W	Color	B&W	Color	B&W	Color	B&W	Color	B&W	Color	B&W	Color	B&W	Color	B&W	Color	
1. Cost per copy of 8½"x11":	\$ 0.50	\$ 0.60	\$ 0.25	\$ 0.50	\$ 0.15	\$ 0.80	\$ 1.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 0.50	\$ 1.00	\$ 0.07	\$ 0.30	N/C	N/C	\$ 0.25	\$ 1.25	\$ 0.02	\$ 1.00	\$ 0.25	\$ 0.75	
2. Cost per copy of 24"x36":	\$ 3.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 3.25	\$ 6.50	\$ 5.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 2.50	\$ 5.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 6.60	\$ 31.50	\$ 3.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 5.00	

Edyta Jolicoeur
7/18/2019